1/21/2010

READY MIX CONCRETE - QUADRANT 1
(Addison, Campbell, Caton, Corning, Erwin, Hornby, Lindley, Rathbone, Thurston & Tuscarora)

BiD DATE: 1/29/2010
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/29/2010-12/31/2010

Coots Concrete Inc., 7421 Telegraph Rd., Bath, NY 14810 (607) 776-3966 / (607) 776-3919

Elam Materials, Inc., PO Box 337, Mount Morris, NY 14510 (585) 658-2248 / (585) 658-4054

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc., 6895 Ellicott Street Pavilion, NY 14525 (585) 584-3132 / (585) 884-8743
Wades Concrete, 206 W. Water St., Addison, NY 14801 (607) 359-3436 / (607) 359-3652

COOTS I] ELAM I] HANSON Il WADES

INTOTO PRICE BID PER CUBIC YARD OF PRODUCT

NYSDOT Class A for Structures $100.00 No Bid $103.00 $102.00
NYSDOT Class H for Structures $106.00 No Bid $106.00 $103.00
NYSDOT Class HP for Structures No Bid No Bid $155.00 No Bid
E\IC\I(_SS[Iz/IC))T Controlled Low Strength Material $79.00 No Bid $84.75 $76.00

AWARDED BY THE PWC oN 1/29/2010 AS SHADED
PW-10-019-B (Page 1)



1/21/2010

READY MIX CONCRETE - QUADRANT 2
(CAMERON, CANISTEO, GREENWOOD, HARTSVILLE, JASPER, TROUPSBURG, WEST UNION & WOODHULL)

BiD DATE: 1/29/2010
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/29/2010-12/31/2010

Coots Concrete Inc., 7421 Telegraph Rd., Bath, NY (607) 776-3966 / (607) 776-3919

Elam Materials, Inc., PO Box 337, Mount Morris, NY 14510 (585) 658-2248 / (585) 658-4054

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc., 6895 Ellicott Street Pavilion, NY 14525 (585) 584-3132 / (585) 884-8743
Wades Concrete, 206 W. Water St., Addison, NY 14801 (607) 359-3436 / (607) 359-3652

COOTS I] ELAM I] HANSON I‘ WADES

INTOTO PRICE BID PER CUBIC YARD OF PRODUCT

NYSDOT Class A for Structures No Bid No Bid $105.00 $104.00
NYSDOT Class H for Structures No Bid No Bid $108.00 $105.00
NYSDOT Class HP for Structures No Bid No Bid $155.00 No Bid
NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM) No Bid No Bid $84.75 $80.00

AWARDED BY THE PWC oN 1/29/2010 AS SHADED
PW-10-019-B (Page 2)



READY MIX CONCRETE - QUADRANT 3
(Avoca, Cohocton, Dansville, Fremont, Hornellsville, Howard & Wayland)

BiD DATE: 1/29/2010

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/29/2010-12/31/2010

Coots Concrete Inc., 7421 Telegraph Rd., Bath, NY (607) 776-3966 / (607) 776-3919

Elam Materials, Inc., PO Box 337, Mount Morris, NY 14510 (585) 658-2248 / (585) 658-4054
Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc., 6895 Ellicott Street Pavilion, NY 14525 (585) 584-3132 / (585) 884-8743
Wades Concrete, 206 W. Water St., Addison, NY 14801 (607) 359-3436 / (607) 359-3652

1/21/2010

COOTS

ELAM

Il HANSON Il WADES

INTOTO PRICE BID PER CUBIC YARD OF PRODUCT

NYSDOT Class A for Structures No Bid $94.00 $94.00 No Bid
NYSDOT Class H for Structures No Bid $97.00 $97.00 No Bid
NYSDOT Class HP for Structures No Bid No Bid $155.00 No Bid
NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM) No Bid $73.00 $70.00 No Bid

AWARDED BY THE PWC oN 1/29/2010 AS SHADED

PW-10-019-B (Page 3)



1/21/2010

READY MIX CONCRETE - QUADRANT 4
(BATH, BRADFORD, PRATTSBURGH, PULTENEY, URBANA, WAYNE & WHEELER)

BiD DATE: 1/29/2010
CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/29/2010-12/31/2010

Coots Concrete Inc., 7421 Telegraph Rd., Bath, NY (607) 776-3966 / (607) 776-3919

Elam Materials, Inc., PO Box 337, Mount Morris, NY 14510 (585) 658-2248 / (585) 658-4054

Hanson Aggregates New York, Inc., 6895 Ellicott Street Pavilion, NY 14525 (585) 584-3132 / (585) 884-8743
Wades Concrete, 206 W. Water St., Addison, NY 14801 (607) 359-3436 / (607) 359-3652

COOTS Il ELAM Il HANSON Il WADES

INTOTO PRICE BID PER CUBIC YARD OF PRODUCT

NYSDOT Class A for Structures $100.00 No Bid $105.00 No Bid
NYSDOT Class H for Structures $106.00 No Bid $108.00 No Bid
NYSDOT Class HP for Structures No Bid No Bid $155.00 No Bid
NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM) $79.00 No Bid $84.75 No Bid

AWARDED BY THE PWC oN 1/29/2010 AS SHADED
PW-10-019-B (Page 4)



